
 

 

 
Morning Humor 
My dog sleeps about 20 hours a day.  He has his food 
prepared for him. He can eat whenever he wants.  His meals 
are provided at no cost to him.  He visits the Dr. once a year 
for his checkup, and again during the year if any medical 
needs arise.  For this he pays nothing and nothing is 
required of him.  He lives in a nice neighborhood in a house 
that is much larger than he needs and he is not required to 
do any upkeep.  If he makes a mess, someone else cleans it 
up.  He has his choice of luxurious places to sleep.  He 
receives these accommodations absolutely free.  He is 
living like a King, and has absolutely no expenses 
whatsoever.  All of his costs are picked up by others who 
go out and earn a living every day.  I was just thinking 
about all this, and suddenly it hit me like a brick ... I think 
my dog is a member of Congress! 
 
After writing a simple equation on the board the teacher 
asked if anyone could solve the problem.  Little Johnny 
walked up to the board, erased it and said, “Problem 
Solved.” 
 
I went to the doctor to see if he can help me to stop 
smoking.  He suggested that every time I felt like smoking I 
should reach for a chocolate bar.  It didn't work, because 
no matter how hard I tried I couldn't get the chocolate bar 
to light. 
 
My sister told me to take the spider out instead of killing 
him......So we went in a bar, had a few beers, it was fun.. it 
turns out he was a web designer. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
Are you feeling a little puny?  The Key Club may be able to 
take care of that and bring a smile to your face, take the 
slack out of your baggy clothes and fill out the wrinkles 
forming about your face.  After a couple years of no fund 
raising the club is about to launch a couple weeks of donut 
sales to fatten the treasury.  Expect to see a key clubber or 
two one morning at our meeting to give you a chance to 
become the proud owner of a dozen or two of the donuts. 
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Suddenly, a tiny yet b 

 

eautiful fairy appeared on their table.  

She said, 'For being such an 

exemplary married couple and for 

being to each other for all this 

time, I will grant you each a wish.'  

 

Winthrop Club 
      Pop 29 
     Welcome 



 

 

 

 
For the second time in the history of Liberty Bell football 
our players are contenders in the State Tournament.  
Cusick ran into hungry Mountain Lions and was battered 
52-20.  I think we can expect to see a request for some help 
feeding the team as they travel for their next game. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
It sounds like everyone is looking forward to Christmas at 
the End of the Road with enthusiasm.  We have a tree and 
we have our trustworthy photographer.  Santa is signed up!  
The Key Club will provide elves and recorders and candy 
cane deliverers.  Get your name on the volunteer list at this 
meeting and don’t forget we need some more stuff for the 
Manger Mall.  Get your presents or bring a pocket full of 
cash. 
 
Jokes? 
 
"Yes, Theo, what is it?" asked the teacher.  "I don’t want to 
alarm you, Miss Davis, but my dad said if I don't get better 
grades, someone was going to be in big trouble." 
 
A real estate agent was showing a woman through a 
beautiful room at the top of a large hotel.  "Now in this wing 
we have the master bedroom, bath, and den."  The woman 
interrupted suspiciously, "And den what?" 
 
 

 
     

                     Upcoming Events    
     
    Nov 27     Christmas at the End of the Road 
    Nov 30     Lunch Meeting for planning 
    Dec 28     Christmas Breakfast 
     
 
     
 
    
    

   


